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From: Jake Saltzman <jsalt.saltzman@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, April 12, 2021 8:00 PM

To: Conklin, Mike

Subject: Re: 16 Rivergate Woods $1000 Fine

Here's my contact information:

Jake Saltzman ;/A E é’ @;} }/

120 Williams Rd Trumbull CT 06611

(917) 238-2440

On Mon, Apr 12, 2021 at 10:51 AM Conklin, Mike <Mike.Conklin@wiltonct.org> wrote:

Jake — Please email me your contact info including: Name, Mailing Address, Phone Numbers.

Did Ms. lkegame pay the $500 fine that was issued by the Commission and upheld by the Citation Hearing Officer?

Mike Conklin
Director of Environmental Affairs
Town of Wilton

238 Danbury Road

Wilton. CT 06897

Phone (203) 563-0182

Fax (203) 563-0284

From: lake Saltzman <jsalt.saltzman@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, Aprit 9, 2021 7:45 PM

To: Conklin, Mike <Mike.Conklin@WILTONCT.ORG>

Cc: Larkin, Elizabeth <glizabeth.larkin@wiltonct.org>; Mieko lkegame <mieko615@acl.com>; arnoldanne@me.com;
Herter, Zen <Zen.Herter@WILTONCT.ORG>

Subject: 16 Rivergate Woods $1000 Fine




Hi Mike,

Following the hearing yesterday we are looking to repeal the fine of $1000 issued March 25th to Mieko Ikegame at 16
Rivergate Waoods. | have cc'd Liz Larkin as | am aware you are out of office.

Thank you and have a nice weekend.

Best,

-Jake Saltzman



